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Penile implants, a cultural practice in the carceral milieu 
of French West Indies region: A case report
Dear Editor,

Penile implants are foreign bodies, usually polished in a 
nodular shape, voluntarily inserted under the skin of the penis. 
It is a common practice in the Caribbean prison environment.1 
The purpose of this practice varies from sexual to socio-
cultural context.2 We report a case of penile implant seen in 
the Dermatology department of the University Hospital of 
Martinique, French West Indies.

A 41-year-old gentleman visited the dermatology department 
seeking removal of beads from his penile area.  During 
clinical examination, eight subcutaneous nodules were 
detected on the penis. These nodules appeared to be firm, 
non-inflamed, movable, and not adhering to the subcutaneous 

tissues. [Figure 1]. Patient had inserted these beads himself 
with the assistance of his prison cellmate 21 years ago. 
Before incarceration, the patient engaged in heterosexual 
activity and exhibited high risk behaviour, including having 
multiple partners. Serology for HIV, hepatitis B and C, and 
VDRL were performed prior to surgery and were negative. 
We surgically removed all of the beads, measuring 0.8–1 cm 
in diameter, by simple incision of the superficial skin layer 
and opening of the peripheral fibrous envelope, and then 
closing by simple suture. Six of the beads were made with 
ivory dominoes, and the last two with a plastic toothbrush. 
The post-operative follow-up was uneventful, with complete 
healing within 7 days after surgery.
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Figure 1a: Subcutaneous nodules of the penis foreskin. Figure 1b: Post-surgical penile beads called “love balls”.
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This phenomenon of self- or hetero-implantation of penile 
subcutaneous beads is an ancient practice well-known 
in Southeast Asia.2 It is mentioned in the Kama Sutra and 
among the Yakuza as a rite of transition and of belonging to 
the clan.3 It then spread with immigration to Eastern Europe, 
Australia, and America and has multiple names depending 
on the region, such as “love balls in Martinique, but also 
“marbles”, “bouglous or “dominoes in other Caribbean 
regions.4 Today, this practice can be found in various parts 
of the world, with similar significance among different social 
groups such as prisoners, military units in Russia and Asia, 
low socio-cultural communities in South-East Asia, and 
criminal organisations in Japan.2 Other voluntary cultural 
sexual modifications are practiced in certain communities 
for hygienic reasons, for example, circumcision in Africa.5 
Penile implant practice is well known in the prison 
environment of the French West Indies region. In 2019, a 
study conducted in French Guiana reported that 68% of 
prisoners had penile implants.6 The insertion of these objects 
is voluntary, motivated by false beliefs of increased virility, 
sexual performance, and sexual pleasuring of the partner but 
also by socio-cultural motivations of belonging to the group. 
Their round or oblong shape without asperities facilitates 
their introduction after a simple incision with a razor blade. 
This procedure is often performed under poor hygienic 
conditions and is associated with a high risk of infection and 
transmission of viral infections such as HIV, hepatitis B or C, 
and other sexually transmitted diseases in this population.6 
Transformation into squamous cell carcinoma has also been 
documented, although it is typically linked with additional 
risk factors for genital carcinoma.7 In the West Indies, this 
cultural tradition, observed among a vulnerable population, 
necessitates physicians to provide essential counselling, 
conduct comprehensive clinical examinations, and screen for 
sexually transmitted infections when treating these patients.
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